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CPX/PEC/Memo.14/EQUIP/flj

16 December 1982

To: Mme Fontaine—Eboué, ED/SPO/nflF

Through: D. Linkowski, Chief, L,K;PEC(:;¢V"~

From: N. Tabackman, Cvx/PEC

Subject: ANC/82/002 - Equipment

This is in reference to equipment procurement for the subject

project.

The requisition submitted by Mr. T.K. Maseko, Principal, with

his letter to you of 1/10/82 and approved by your Memo ED/SPO/RaF/9012/25

of 20/10/82 will only cost about $7000—$7500 versus the equipment budget

_ of $HOOOO (plus $80000 for Publications). -

Therefore, the funds available, $32000 to $33000, should be

rephased into 1983, or a requisition for the remaining funds or a request

for local purchase, accompanied by proforma invoices, must be submitted

urgently if procurement is to be made before the end of the year.

NQr—‘J
N. Tabackman

cc: ED/AO
CPX/AFR ‘

Miss R. Kivisté, PEC - Req.210072 refers -
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To : l-ir. Bernardout, LL/Z LM c. c.:r.:331.1.1‘u‘i, 231:: as

I 533.1. 21:.'A 1 A.L“.;1.J‘.i:1

From : G. Fonta;3,‘£bcu- Lu/nEO/REE L:.1a:ekc; ”LSQUCIG,
l"... ‘ - ..
Junéaniu

  

As you were informed this project was approvea by UNDP New

York on 30 August 1982.

During my mission to Tanzania, tha Principal of SOIAFCO gave

me the attached information which was needed for the hmplementation

of the project.

I. Teachers‘ Salar1e8_ ' . .

We approve the 21 teachers listed in the enclosei dccuaentatio:
from 1 to 21 (20 + 1 for Adult Education).

Please convey our authorization t0 UEDP Dar es S;la¢m fortthe

payment of the salaries totalling the equivalent of US dellars 48,40:

(budget line 12) for the period June - December 1982.

II.Sugggrt Personnel

Please also authorize the payment of the salariee cf the

support personnel (equivalent of US dollars 7,900 for the paricd

June - December 1982). The names of the personnel concazncd Appear

on page 3 of that‘.v. of staff (n' 25 to 35).

III.Studenta' taintenance

Although the school year started in Septanber 1982, all the

children and students are in the campus all the year round. 50 we

are giving our authorization for the payment of their maintenance

for the period July - December 1982.

The necessary funds are available under budget line 32. 01 for

a total of US dollars 132,394.

Thank you for your grampt action.
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To : Hr. Tabachgn, inj

Via hr. £¢rua;u at, 3;,

From: C. Fencm; Pro eat LNC 82 002 (SQHAFCC)   

   

   

Please find attachefi with & second ccgy oi the Freject Document

the list of school chemicals and equipaent suuaitted to me during my

recent mission to Tanzania, together with the list of hock; me are

transmitting directly to the library.

I thank you for ybur grompt action in placing oxéer for the

equipment requested which muet be addressed to 2

Mr. OUM‘TARA
UHDP Resident Regresentative

P.0. Box 9182

DAR E8 SALAAM (Tanzania)

For ARCz Morggcro

The necessary funds are availabla unier the ‘

for a total amount of US dollars 120,003 for tha gear

  


